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ItÕs very interesting that so many people in their role as voters are clamoring for and 
demanding ÒchangeÓ from our presidential candidates, yet "change'' so often is resisted by 
those same people in the work place when they are in their role as employees.  
 
The candidates are falling over themselves to convince the electorate that they are the true 
leaders of change.  They are campaigning to shake things up, to break some dishes. They are 
climbing on higher and higher soapboxes to pledge themselves to the mantra of change, 
because of course, change is a good thing. 
 
The assumption -- or perhaps the hope -- of electing a candidate of change is that we will 
benefit from change, so not only should we not resist change, we should embrace it as a 
necessary friend. 
 
 And then thereÕs the business world. On the one hand, "change'' usually is embraced by the 
investor community because like the electorate, investors see benefits for themselves. A 
companyÕs stock prices can rise (and fall) when a "change'' announcement is made, such as a 
new strategy, a new CEO or a merger proposal.  Wall Street rewards aggressive change 
actions and often punishes the prudent and the cautious.  
 
Inside of companies, however, there tends to be a different reaction to organizational change 
announcements or dramatic new initiatives and itÕs more like dread than desire. I think this is 
especially so at lower levels of the organizational food chain and among those who consider 
themselves relatively powerless. Change is seen as something that happens to them not for 
them. 
 
Too often in the last 15 years in the work place, the "C word'' has meant downsizings or 
doing more with less or seeing familiar and comfortable work processes go away.  It has 
meant benefit takeaways. It has meant "mean and lean.''   
 
Employees often understand that changes like that are good for the company, but are left 
wondering whatÕs in it for them. TheyÕre usually told something like this: The changes are 
necessary for increased competitiveness and that is the best way to provide for job 
security. Actually, that principle usually is true and as a manager and a consultant, IÕve given 
that speech myself countless times, but people have grown jaded and cynical.       



 
There has been so much change in the work place that we train managers in how to introduce 
change and how to manage the potential and often inevitable resistance. We coach leaders on 
how to involve employees in the change processes to build support. Compliance is necessary, 
but it also can be the enemy of commitment. 
 
Yet, many of the same people who roll their eyes at work and hope that "this too will pass'' 
when a change is announced are genuflecting at the altar of change when they are acting as 
Joe Citizen and not Joe Employee. 
 
Change by itself is neither positive nor negative. It depends on the context and the extent to 
which people feel the benefits of the change outweigh the costs of achieving it.                
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Opinions expressed solely are those of the writer. Mike Hoban, of Crown Point, is a senior 
consultant for an international leadership development and training firm. Send mail to him 
c/o The Times, or e-mail him at business-at-large@sbcglobal.net.  
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